TITUS COUNTY
CULVERTS - BID # 2023-09
11-Sep-23

# Dates of Public Notice in Local Newspaper

August 12, 2023 & August 19, 2023

## Deadline for Bids Delivered to County Auditor's Office

August 29, 2023 at 9:00 AM

### **Date Bids Opened**

August 29, 2023 at 9:30 AM

## Bids Received, Date Received, Time Received, Method of Delivery

National Wholesale Supply
Discount Culverts, LLC
1405 W. Ferguson Road, Mt Pleasant, Texas
965 CR 2304, Sulphur Springs, Texas

Jeremy Owens, Manager Josh Whitlock, Owner

August 21, 2023 at 3:05 PM, Hand Delivered August 28, 2023 at 10:39 AM, Mail

# **Contract Effective Dates**

This bid is scheduled to be presented for approval in Commissioners' Court on September 11, 2023. It is for a 1 year contract with option to renew for 2 additional year upon agreement by vendor and County. Bid is initially effective September 11, 2023 upon approval by Titus County Commissioners' Court.

### **SUMMARY OF BID ITEMS**

Responses were not received on each type of culvert requested. This summary includes all of the responses that were returned.

## **FOB LOCATION & ADDRESS FOR PICK UP**

Nat'l Wholesale - 1405 W Ferguson Road, Mt. Pleasant, TX Discount Culverts - 965 CR 2304, Sulphur Springs, TX

#### **DELIVERY OPTIONS:**

Nat'l Wholesale offers no delivery options.

Discount Culverts offers delivery at \$ 4.00 per mile one way or at \$ 2.00 per mile round trip.

	Nat'l Wholesale	Discount Culverts
NON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT:	YES	YES
GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE: Commissioners to determine the need for insurance	NO	NO

TITUS COUNTY		DEADLINE: August 29	2023 AT 9:00 AM		Page 2 of 3				
PROPOSAL SHEET	- CULVERTS	BID #: 2023-09							
The second secon		RTS - PRICE PER 1 (ONE) I	OOT SECTION			11/2			
National Wholesal	e Bid Amoun	ts:		Discount C	ulverts Bid	Amounts:			
DIAMETER									
12 inches				\$ 37.00					
15 inches				\$ 37.70					
18 inches	No Bid			\$ 38.00					
24 inches				\$ 57.00					
30 inches				\$ 84.00					
36 inches				\$ 114.00					
						i i			
PLASTIC CULVERT	S - SINGLE WA	ALL - PRICE PER FOOT							
<b>National Wholesa</b>	le Bid Amoun	ts:		Discount C	ulverts Bid	Amounts:			
DIAMETER									
	No Bid				No Bid	7			
PLASTIC CULVERTS	- DOUBLE W	ALL - PRICE PER FOOT							
National Wholesal	e Bid Amount	ts:		Discount C	ulverts Bid	Amounts:	L		
DIAMETER					A George Ship Eto S	Albert Action and Albert Action and			
12 inches	\$ 7.67	7		\$ 5.43					
15 inches	\$ 11.26			\$ 8.28		1			
18 inches	\$ 15.26			\$ 11.59		7/1			
24 inches	\$ 24.92			\$ 19.31		· V			
30 inches	\$ 35.53			\$ 26.67					
36 inches	\$ 47.24			\$ 36.04					
42 inches	\$ 64.43			\$ 47.31					
48 inches	\$ 68.99			\$ 58.56					
60 inches	\$ 130.59			\$ 86.20					
					ble in 4" 6"	8" and 10"	No hid ar	nounts inclu	ded

Vholesale Bid Amounts No Bid.		
STEEL CULVERTS - PRICE PER FOOT, 16 Gauge National Wholesale Bid Amounts: DIAMETER  12 inches 18 inches 24 inches 30 inches 36 inches 60 inches 72 inches 96 inches 120 inches		
National Wholesale Bid Amounts:  DIAMETER  12 inches 18 inches 24 inches 30 inches 36 inches 66 inches 72 inches 96 inches 120 inches		
~ ~		Discount Culverts Bid Amounts:
S		
S	\$ 20.13	
S	\$ 25.30	
s	\$ 29.90	
S	No Bid.	
30 inches 36 inches 48 inches 60 inches 72 inches 96 inches	\$ 41.40	
36 inches 48 inches 60 inches 72 inches 96 inches	\$ 55.78	
48 inches 60 inches 72 inches 96 inches 120 inches	\$ 59.80	
60 inches 72 inches 96 inches	\$ 92.00	
72 inches 96 inches 120 inches	\$ 139.00	
96 inches 120 inches	\$ 161.00	
120 inches	\$ 195.00	
	\$ 249.00	
144 inches	\$ 292.00	
CONNECTING BANDS WITH DIMPLES - PRICE EACH	CH	
National Wholesale Bid Amounts:		Discount Culverts Bid Amounts:
DIAMETER		
12 inches	\$ 37.00	
15 inches	\$ 70.00	
18 inches No Bid.	\$ 83.00	
24 inches	\$ 113.00	
30 inches	No bid	
36 inches	\$ 167.00	
48 inches	\$ 221.00	

7 =